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Will be waiting for your reply and publish the paper.

[Quoted text hidden]

.@ PMF_2022_ Musviyanti_6205.pdf
506K

Hariman Bone <hariman.bone@feb.unmul.ac.id> Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 12:56 PM
To: v.matiukhina@businessperspectives.org

Dear Valeria Matiukhina
We have checked and approved the article.
Best regard

Hariman Bone
[Quoted text hidden]



gl]q{}lmssl\.’rf{‘smmp{ Hariman Bone <hariman.bone@feb.unmul.ac.id>

RE: MA6205

1 message

v.matiukhina@businessperspectives.org <v.matiukhina@businessperspectives.org> Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 5;30'3

To: Hariman Bone <hariman.bone@feb.unmul.ac.id>
Cc: fibriyani.nur.khairin@feb.unmul.ac.id, rizky.yudaruddin@feb.unmul.ac.id,
muhammad.abadan.syakura@feb.unmul.ac.id

Dear authors,

Your article « Structure of local government budgets and local fiscal autonomy: Evidence from Indonesia » has been published on
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Kind regards,
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Best Regard

Hariman Bone



On Fri, Jul 22, 2022 at 2:01 AM <v.matiukhina@businessperspectives.org> wrote:

Dear Hariman Bone,
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Issue 1, 2022 of the journal “Public and Municipal Finance”.

As soon as the payment will be done, I'll provide you with APC confirmation letter to let you have the
reimbursement from your institution (if you need).

The article processing charge (APC) is 495 euros.
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Details of payment
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you the payment
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PAYMENT.
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