From: "annisa nurrachmawati" <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com>
To: "editor@mjphm.org.my" <editor@mjphm.org.my>
Sent: Mon, Sep 11, 2017 at 11:41
Subject: progress of manuscript
Dear editor
 
I have submitted my paper with title Kamboh : A qualitative study of postpartum care in Kutai ethnic tribe, East Kalimantan Indonesia to your journal via email on 24 May 2017
 
I would be gratefull if you can inform me whether there has been any further progress in my submission
 
Yours Sincerely 
Annisa Nurrachmawati
Student of PhD Program, Faculty of Medicine Universitas Gadjah Mada

On Sunday, October 22, 2017, 11:40:29 PM GMT+7, Joyce Encluna <joycencluna@gmail.com> wrote: 


Dear Dr, Nurrachmawati,

Please send two reviewers for your paper as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Joyce M. Encluna,
Editorial Assistant
Malaysia Journal of Public Health Medicine



From: "Joyce Encluna" <joycencluna@gmail.com>
To: "annisa nurrachmawati" <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com>
Cc: "Abed Ali" <abed11k@gmail.com>, "<editor@mjphm.org.my>" <editor@mjphm.org.my>
Sent: Thu, May 31, 2018 at 0:38
Subject: Re: 669
Dear Dr. Nurrachmawati, 


We would like to inform you that only one reviewer provided evaluation on the manuscript. In this regard, kindly provide another reviewer for the paper.


Thank you.


Very truly yours,


Joyce

Dear editorial assistant
 
As a respon for your email i would like to suggest the following potential reviewers because they would have the requisite background to evaluate my manuscript objectively.
Dr. Siwi padmawati, MA ( siwi.padmawati@gmail.com)   she is  among those with the expertise on medical anthropology
And dr.R. Detty Siti Nurdiati MPH,PhD, SpOG (K) ( dnurdiati@yahoo.com) she is expertise on maternal and child health
Sincerely
Annisa Nurrachmawati
----- Forwarded Message -----
From: "Joyce Encluna" <joycencluna@gmail.com>
To: "annisa nurrachmawati" <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com>
Cc: "Abed Ali" <abed11k@gmail.com>, "<editor@mjphm.org.my>" <editor@mjphm.org.my>
Sent: Mon, Jun 4, 2018 at 11:17
Subject: Re: 669_“Kamboh”: A Qualitative Study Of Postpartum Care In Kutai Ethnic Tribe, East Kalimantan, Indonesia
Dear Dr. Annisa Nurrachmawati, 


Please find attached comments from the reviewers.

Kindly revise the manuscript based on the comments/suggestions of the reviewers.  Once revised, please email the updated manuscript to us.

Thank you.

Joyce
2 Attachments







On Thu, Mar 28, 2019 at 12:24 PM annisa nurrachmawati <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com> wrote:
I have submitted my revised manuscript titled 669_“Kamboh”: A Qualitative Study Of Postpartum Care In Kutai Ethnic Tribe, East Kalimantan, Indonesia and our last communication said it was in process for editor clearance, however, there has been no information ever since. I would be grateful if you could give some information if there has been any further progress on my submission. 
Sincerely 
Annisa N 
Public Health Faculty Mulawarman University
From: "Joyce Encluna" <joycencluna@gmail.com>
To: "annisa nurrachmawati" <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com>
Cc: "Abed Ali" <abed11k@gmail.com>, "<editor@mjphm.org.my>" <editor@mjphm.org.my>
Sent: Tue, Apr 2, 2019 at 16:41
Subject: Re: inquiry email about manuscript 669
Dear Dr. Annisa, 

Please find attached manuscript for your review. 

Please check carefully the manuscript contents as the following:
- Title
- Authors names - PLEASE INCLUDE in the manuscript
- Author's affiliations - PLEASE INCLUDE in the manuscript
- Whole contents
- Tables and figures
- References and mjphm style

Then send the confirmed draft back to us within 1 week if possible.

For payment, here the account details for all MJPHM transaction.

a) Account Name: PERSATUAN PAKAR PERUBATAN KESIHATAN AWAM MALAYSIA
b) Account Number: 80-0033317-7
c) Bank Address: CIMB Bank Cawangan Taman Mutiara, Cheras, 2468 Jalan 
Mutiara Timur 1, Taman Mutiara, Cheras, 56100 Kuala Lumpur
d) SWIFT CODE: CIBBMYKL

Please pay USD300 to the above account for publication fee.

Thank you.

With much respect

Joyce 


rom: "Abed Alabed" <abed11k@gmail.com>
To: "annisa nurrachmawati" <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com>
Sent: Wed, Apr 10, 2019 at 16:57
Subject: Re: respon to galley proof for manuscript 669
Received with thanks.
 
Pls email the author to confirm this copy for publication. Then we will check only the format but for the content, author should check and confirm.
 
Thank you

On Tue, Apr 9, 2019 at 9:59 AM annisa nurrachmawati <nasywa_mzi@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editor of MJPHM
This email as a respon to galley proof for manuscript 669, for your information 
I had added author names and affilition, carefully checking the graphic ( in original draft from galley proof contain some tables, it wasn’t comes from my manuscript , I had deleted that tables), also had checked references to meet the requirements. The proof of bank transfer for publication fee is also attached. Please kindly check and thank you for your time and assistance
Sincerely yours
Annisa Nurrachmawati 

