
On Tue, Apr 30, 2019 at 10:24 AM ASEG Secretariat <secretary@aseg.org.au> wrote: 

Dear Piter 

I am pleased to inform you that your application for ASEG Active - Group I & II Countries - 5 Year 
Membership  has been reviewed by the Federal Executive and your membership has been approved. On 
behalf of the Society, I welcome you to the Australian Society of Exploration Geophysicists. 

This year the ASEG has introduced a 5-year membership, please let us know if this membership type is 
of interest to you. 

As a benefit, you will receive both of ASEG’s publications, Preview and Exploration 
Geophysics electronically.  There will be no postage surcharge added to the membership fees for any 
membership group for hard copies. 

As a member, you have the opportunity to participate in the activities of the Society through 
conferences, technical meetings, committees and journals. We would value your technical contributions 
to Exploration Geophysics and Preview. Your thoughts, views and potential participation would also be 
appreciated in the various committees that address issues from education, research, and other areas 
that challenge your profession. Please consult the website www.aseg.org.au for further information 
about the activities of the Society. 

From January 2019 Taylor & Francis will be our new publisher for Exploration Geophysics and Preview 
and all members when renewing online will be requested to grant the ASEG permission to provide 
Taylor and Francis with their email and postal addresses. Taylor & Francis have given an undertaking not 
to use the member list for any purpose other than advertising and distributing Exploration Geophysics 
and Preview. 

All members wishing to continue to obtain online access to the Exploration Geophysics will be asked to 
consent to the publisher’s standard terms and conditions of online supply and understand that member 
access to Exploration Geophysics is on a member’s private use only basis and it shall not be networked 
to any other site, library or public website. 

As you applied for your membership on the ASEG website you should already have your login details, 
which will now allow you to log into the ASEG website, access your membership profile and make 
changes to your details whenever you like. 

If you have any difficulties logging in or queries regarding your membership of the ASEG please feel free 
to contact me via email or telephone. 

Welcome to the ASEG! 

Yours sincerely 
Alison 
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