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25 messages

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 4 August 2022 at 12:20
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

On Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 9:31 AM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:

Herman:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal, "Pharmacognostic
Profile of Simplicia and Ethanolic Leaves Extract from Indonesian Piper betle var. nigra”.

Our decision is to: Accept Submission

| truly appreciate all your hard work, dedication and commitments towards this work. This paper is well
described clearly and it is accepted to publish without any revisions.

Publication Charges - GBP 1100 We request you to confirm your mode of payment 1) Credit Card or 2) Bank
Transfer. An invoice can be raised accordingly.

Awaiting your response.

Regards,

Emily Flora
On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 5:56 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Herman,

Thank you for your kind response and confirming the charges. Soon, we will get back to you with the review
comments.

Regards,

Emily Flora

On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 8:45 AM Herman < herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id > wrote:
Thank you for your understanding. Ok, please proceed to the next step. We hope that this article will
be published soon. thanks

On Mon, 18 Jul 2022, 20:51 Pharmacognosy Journal, <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Herman,

Thanks for your email. Considering your request, you are requested to pay 1100 GBP upon the
article acceptance.

Kindly confirm to initiate the review process.

Regards,
Emily Flora

On Mon, Jul 18, 2022 at 2:53 PM Herman < herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id > wrote:
Thank you for the response regarding theOjournal that I sent.
We will endeavor to pay for it. but if it is allowed, can0it be reduced?

Thank you for your attention...

On Sat, 16 Jul 2022 at 18:06, Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Herman,

Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have
received your article entitled "Pharmacognostic Profile of Simplicia and Ethanolic

Leaves Extract from Indonesian Piper betle var. nigra”. The article is now under our
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PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the article
status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to
recover our editorial and production expenses. They cover the range of publishing
services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and
authors, article production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services,
and customer services. The publication charges are 1249 GBP for the accepted
article. You are required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your
article (after peer-review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review
process.

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.
Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,

Emily Flora

Managing Editor
Pharmacognosy Journal

ISSN: 0975-3575

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 4 August 2022 at 17:49
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Thank you for your trust.
we will pay by bank transfer.

thanks
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 5 August 2022 at 17:55
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Thank you for your kind response. Please find the attached wire transfer invoice. Kindly make the payment and send
us the receipt at the earliest.
Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

x| PJ-22-916 Wire Transfer Invoice.pdf
90K

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 5 August 2022 at 22:19
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

thanks. | will notify you after the payment is complete.
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 5 August 2022 at 23:31
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Ok, thank you.
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[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 10 August 2022 at 14:56
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Could you please let me know the current status of the payment?
Awaiting your reply.
Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 10 August 2022 at 18:38
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

sorry, it's a bit large so we need some time to collect it from the author.
if possible can be lowered again for the payment.

thanks
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 10 August 2022 at 18:40
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Thanks for your email. We have already provided you the discount. We request you to kindly make the payment by
15 th of this month.

Regards,

Emily flora
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 10 August 2022 at 18:45
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Ok, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 15 August 2022 at 19:04
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Thank you for making the payment. We request you to send us the following details.

1) Graphical abstract: A graphical abstract is a graphical or visual equivalent of a written abstract.
Please prepare a figure summarizing your abstract and send us

2) About authors: Send us the biography of all authors associated with the article along with the
recent photographs of authors. The biography should be as concise as possible (max words:
100).

Kindly send us the requested details at the earliest.

Regards,
Emily Flora

[Quoted text hidden]
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Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 15 August 2022 at 20:31
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

thanks for the confirmation.
We will make it soon.

Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 15 August 2022 at 22:30
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Ok, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 20 August 2022 at 01:24
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

below I attach a Graphical Abstract and About Author
thanks

[Quoted text hidden]

@ Graphical Abstract and About Author.docx
1459K

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 22 August 2022 at 17:54
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Thank you for sending us the requested details. Within 10 working days, you will receive the galley proof.
Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 22 August 2022 at 23:27
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Ok, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 24 August 2022 at 11:52
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Please check references that do not include title names, | searched but found only 1 and 16 references.
Kindly update the remaining references with article titles and send them back.

Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

@ References.docx
25K

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id> 27 August 2022 at 09:35
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Thank you, | will do that.
[Quoted text hidden]
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Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

27 August 2022 at 22:05

Attached, we convey the improvement of references and improvements to the authors and their

affiliates

thanks
[Quoted text hidden]

@ References.docx
28K

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Received, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>
To: herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id
[Quoted text hidden]
Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>
Dear Herman,
Please find the attached galley proof. Let me know if any changes are needed.

Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ PJ-14-5-916.pdf
— 3027K

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

please correct the author and affiliation as attached, because there is a hame error
thank you

[Quoted text hidden]

@ Afiliasi.docx
23K

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

29 August 2022 at 15:13

5 September 2022 at 10:36

7 September 2022 at 21:17

7 September 2022 at 21:45

7 September 2022 at 21:46

Kindly highlight the changes in the galley proof (not in word document) on a sticky note and send us back, so that

our production team will make the changes accordingly.

Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>
To: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

7 September 2022 at 22:57
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[Quoted text hidden]

&) PJ-14-5-916.pdf
— 3008K

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 9 September 2022 at 16:55
To: Herman <herman@farmasi.unmul.ac.id>

Dear Herman,

Please find the attached corrected galley proof.
Regards,

Emily Flora
[Quoted text hidden]

fj PJ-14-5-916.pdf
— 3036K
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